hannah@woltz.com

From: david <david@woltz.com>

Sent: Thursday, October 19, 2023 6:53 PM
To: Hannah Sprague; '‘Bobby Whitlock'
Subject: FW: RE: Lamar Lease

Sent from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone

-------- Original message --------

From: Andy Kelderhouse <andyke@fwinc.com>
Date: 10/17/23 12:02 PM (GMT-05:00)

To: david <david@woltz.com>

Subject: RE: Lamar Lease

Currently paying $375/yr.

From: Andy Kelderhouse

Sent: Tuesday, October 17, 2023 11:49 AM
To: david <david@woltz.com>

Subject: Lamar Lease

It can be terminated with 30 days’ notice — see bottom of attached agreement.

Andy Kelderhouse
President

Fralin & Waldron, Inc.



